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Health and Safety is 
everyone’s responsibility and 
I will do my part.

01

I am responsible for my own 
safety and will always use 
appropriate PPE and request 
it, if it is not available.

02

I will approach my work with 
a positive attitude and 
proactive approach to tasks.

03

I will be respectful, courteous, 
helpful and professional.

04

I will protect myself and 
others in the workplace by 
complying with and 
implementing Risk 
Assessments and COSHH 
forms, as appropriate.

05

I am a valuable member of a 
team; together we can 
achieve more.

06

I am good at what I do, I will 
take pride in my work and act 
as a role model to others.

07

I will work hard to achieve 
deadlines set for me, if I can’t 
I will discuss this with my 
manager in good time.

08

I will communicate clearly, 
effectively and in a timely 
manner with everyone that I 
work with, both staff and 
students.

09

I will ensure that my clothing 
is neat, clean and 
appropriate for the task at 
hand.

10

I am responsible for my own 
development, maintaining 
my skills and keeping my 
knowledge up to date.

11

I have expertise in my field 
and will share my knowledge 
and skills with others.

12
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